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Seeking copy right permission

Catherine Hong Huan HOR <catherinehor@hkbu.edu.hk> Tue, Nov 2, 2021 at 12:10 AM
To: jnejpsite@gmail.com, jneurosci@msubmit.net, jn@sfn.org

Dear editor,
Good day.

| am writing to seek permission to reuse (with citation) a part of our raw data recently published in The Journal of
Neuroscience as the supporting data for publication in our prospective protocol manuscript to be published in the
protocol journal, JOVE.

In our previous published work titled, 'Multifaceted functions of Rab23 on primary cilium- and Hedgehog signaling-
mediated cerebellar granule cell proliferation’ (DOI: https://doi.org/10.1523/JNEUROSCI.3005-20.2021), we studied
primary cilium-dependent Hh signaling pathway on in vivo and in vitro GCP culture. In this work, part of the
results were produced from a newly optimized protocol that we established in our own lab. In particular, we
developed a cost-effective in vitro electroporation method for genetic manipulation in primary GCP culture.

We believe that sharing this optimized cost-effective protocol would be beneficial to the neuroscience community.
Given that our newly established protocol was built in parallel with the work that we published in The Journal of
Neuroscience, we would like to cite and reuse our published data as the evidence to support the success of this
new protocol.

For this reason, we would like to seek your official permission to reuse one set of raw data (i e. Figure 7D-E,
partial data with modification, DOI: https://doi.org/10.1523/JNEUROSCI.3005-20.2021) originating from the JN paper
for our prospective publication in the protocol journal the JoVE.

Our manuscript for JOVE publication is tentatively titled: "Efficient and cost-effective electroporation method to
study primary cilium-dependent Hh signaling pathway in the primary granule precursor culture,”

Appreciate your time and kind consideration on this copyright permission.

We look forward to receiving your favorable response soon.

best regards,

Catherine Hor (Corresponding author )

On Wed, Jun 23, 2021 at 12:07 PM JNeurosci <jneurosci@msubmit.net> wrote:
23rd Jun 2021
Dear Dr. HOR:
| am pleased to inform you that your revised paper, "Multifaceted functions of Rab23 on primary cilium- and
Hedgehog signaling-mediated cerebellar granule cell proliferation," has been accepted for publication in The
Journal of Neuroscience.
Your manuscript will now pass through a series of preproduction checks. Once your manuscript is completely
ready and the publication fee has been paid, you will receive email notification that it has been forwarded to
production.

You will receive a link to the invoice and payment portal within 48 hours. Please note that proofs will not be sent
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to you until 2-3 weeks after and the article will not publish until the publication fee has been received in full.
Publication fees are reduced if the corresponding author is a member of the Society for Neuroscience. The
publication fee is $1,535 for members and $2,185 for non-members. If you would like to join SfN, please visit
our Member Center at https://www.sfn.org/membership. A revised invoice will be sent 24-48 hours after your

membership is updated. If you do not receive an updated invoice within that timeframe, please contact us at
jn@sfn.org.

For a surcharge of $3,340, articles may be made freely available immediately upon publication via the journal's
Open Choice model. To change your article's Open Choice status, please contact jn@sfn.org. All JNeurosci
articles will be freely available 6 months after issue publication.

All authors are invited to submit images to be considered for use on the cover. Please submit your potential
cover images, as well as an image caption and credit information, directly to the peer review system, using the
"Submit Cover Art" link in your manuscript record; you can also send submissions by email to jn@sfn.org.
Additional details on sizing and image specifications can be found in the Information for Authors:
https://www.jneurosci.org/content/information-authors#cover_art

On behalf of the Editorial Board, thank you for submitting this paper to The Journal of Neuroscience.

Yours sincerely,

Dan Sanes

Senior Editor
Journal of Neuroscience

jn permissions <jnpermissions@sfn.org> Fri, Nov 5, 2021 at 2:35 AM
To: Catherine Hong Huan HOR <catherinehor@hkbu.edu.hk>

Hello Dr. Hor,

Thank you for contacting us. Since this is your previous work, no special permissions are needed.

Regards,

Vicente Carmona
Editorial Associate |
Society for Neuroscience | 1121 14th Street NW, Suite 1010, Washington, DC 20005

T: (202) 962-4000 | F: (202) 962-4941 | vcarmona@sfn.org | SfN.org
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