The University of Texas at Austin
Andrew Sligar

107 W. Dean Keeton St

TX, United States

OFFICIAL RECEIPT

Our reference: 4745410971792520
Account Name : Andrew Sigar
Invoice Number RP018045
3-Nov-2018

Dear Sir/Madam,

We herewith acknowledge the receipt of your credit card payment ending in 7024 on 02-Nov-2018
in the amount of USD 118.50 as full payment towards invoice RP018045.

We trust this information meets with your approval.
Yours sincerely,
lan Brent I. Miran

e-mail: ianbrent.miran@yahoo.com



https://ca-live.adyen.com/ca/ca/accounts/showTx.shtml?txType=Payment&pspReference=1625369374392911&accountKey=MerchantAccount.Delta_Print_AMER
mailto:ianbrent.miran@yahoo.com
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Credit Card Payment - Elsevier_ RP018045

3 messages

Andrew D Sligar <asligar@utexas.edu>

Mata, Jesus S. (REPH-MNL ) <jesus.mata@reedelsevier.com> Thu, Nov 1, 2018 at 1:35 PM

To: "asligar@utexas.edu” <asligar@utexas.edu>
Cc: "Maranan, Mary Jane A. (REPH-MNL )" <jane.maranan@reedelsevier.com>

Dear Andrew,

Thanks for the payment.

This is to confirm that we have successfully charged USD 118.50 via MasterCard ending in 7024. The payment has been
posted against invoice RP018045.

Payment Accepted

Your payment was accepted

Payment Details

Kindly advise us any issues/concerns about the statement so we can address them accordingly.

Should you have further questions, please feel free to get in touch.

Kind Regards,

- lesiis 5. Mata
- Credit Control Administrator, Credit Risk & Receivables

ph: +1 937 247 2339
- faw: +1 877 223 1436

jesus.mata @ reedelsevier.com

As a valued customer we appreciate your feedback on the service we deliver to you. If you would like to share
your comments please send an email to the Global Head 02C, O2CUSCollections@ReedElsevier.com.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=758848177f&view=pt&search=all &permthid=thread-f%3A1615957680030648065&dsqt=1&simpl=msg-f%3A1615957680030... 1/4
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Drew Sligar <asligar@utexas.edu> Thu, Nov 1, 2018 at 1:47 PM
To: "Livingston, Jennifer G" <Jenna.L@austin.utexas.edu>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Mata, Jesus S. (REPH-MNL ) <jesus.mata@reedelsevier.com>

Date: Thu, Nov 1, 2018 at 1:35 PM

Subject: Credit Card Payment - Elsevier_ RP018045

To: asligar@utexas.edu <asligar@utexas.edu>

Cc: Maranan, Mary Jane A. (REPH-MNL ) <jane.maranan@reedelsevier.com>

Dear Andrew,
Thanks for the payment.

This is to confirm that we have successfully charged USD 118.50 via MasterCard ending in 7024. The payment has been
posted against invoice RP018045.

Kindly advise us any issues/concerns about the statement so we can address them accordingly.

Should you have further questions, please feel free to get in touch.

Kind Regards,

As a valued customer we appreciate your feedback on the service we deliver to you. If you would like to share
your comments please send an email to the Global Head O2C, O2CUSCollections@ReedElsevier.com.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=758848177f&view=pt&search=all &permthid=thread-f%3A1615957680030648065&dsqt=1&simpl=msg-f%3A1615957680030... 2/4


mailto:jesus.mata@reedelsevier.com
mailto:asligar@utexas.edu
mailto:asligar@utexas.edu
mailto:jane.maranan@reedelsevier.com
mailto:O2CUSCollections@ReedElsevier.com

11/1/2018 UTmail Mail - Credit Card Payment - Elsevier_ RP018045

Drew Sligar

4 attachments

Payment Accepted
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Payment Details

Livingston, Jennifer G <Jenna.L@austin.utexas.edu> Thu, Nov 1, 2018 at 1:48 PM
To: "asligar@utexas.edu” <asligar@utmail.utexas.edu>

Woohoo!

From: Drew Sligar <asligar@utexas.edu>

Sent: Thursday, November 1, 2018 1:47 PM

To: Livingston, Jennifer G <Jenna.L@austin.utexas.edu>
Subject: Fwd: Credit Card Payment - Elsevier_ RP018045

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Mata, Jesus S. (REPH-MNL ) <jesus.mata@reedelsevier.com>

Date: Thu, Nov 1, 2018 at 1:35 PM

Subject: Credit Card Payment - Elsevier_ RP018045

To: asligar@utexas.edu <asligar@utexas.edu>

Cc: Maranan, Mary Jane A. (REPH-MNL ) <jane.maranan@reedelsevier.com>

Dear Andrew,

Thanks for the payment.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=758848177f&view=pt&search=all &permthid=thread-f%3A1615957680030648065&dsqt=1&simpl=msg-f%3A1615957680030... 3/4
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This is to confirm that we have successfully charged USD 118.50 via MasterCard ending in 7024. The payment has been
posted against invoice RP018045.

Kindly advise us any issues/concerns about the statement so we can address them accordingly.

Should you have further questions, please feel free to get in touch.

Kind Regards,

As a valued customer we appreciate your feedback on the service we deliver to you. If you would like to share
your comments please send an email to the Global Head O2C, O2CUSCollections@ReedElsevier.com.

Drew Sligar

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=758848177f&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1615957680030648065&dsqt=1&simpl=msg-f%3A1615957680030...  4/4
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INVOICE NO. RP018045 Our Ref: UKRPINV/SR Fee & Permission/jbsubr/B9780702026997
GR Ref: AG

29 October 2018 Due date: 30 Dec 2018

The University of Texas at Austin
attn: Andrew Sligar

107 W. Dean Keeton St

Austin, 78712

TX, United States
asligar@utexas.edu

4176693356

COLOUR ATLAS OF ANATOMY OF SMALL LABORATORY ANIMALS (VOLUME 1) 2003, ISBN:
9780702026997, Rajtova et al ed, 1 figure only.

Proposed use: To be used in a journal/magazine "JoVE, Preclinical Model of Hind Limb Ischemia in Diabetic
Rabbits".

Payment due: USD 118.50

REMITTANCE SLIP — PLEASE RETURN WITH PAYMENT TO:

PAYMENT OPTIONS

1. By Bank transfer

Remit to: ING Bank NV, Bijlmerplein 888, 1102 MG Amsterdam, The Netherlands, Swift Code: INGBNL2A. You
must quote the Elsevier Invoice Number as a reference.

Bank account:

0020158157 (USD) $§ IBAN: NL17INGB0020158157

0007151730 (EUR) € IBAN: NL81INGB0007151730

0020158165 (JPY) ¥ IBAN: NL92INGB0020158165

2. By Cheque made payable to Elsevier Ltd and sent with a copy of the invoice to addresses:

For Non-US Customers For US Customers

Elsevier Ltd Elsevier Ltd

PO Box 1270 PO Box 7247-6140

1000 BG Amsterdam Philadelphia, PA 19170-6140
The Netherlands USA

Elsevier Limited, The Boulevard, Langford Lane, Kidlington, Oxford, OX5 1GB, UK
VAT no. 494 6272 12



3. By Credit Card. Fill in your credit card details below and send to:

For Non-US Customers For US Customers
Elsevier Ltd Elsevier Ltd

PO Box 1270 Credit and Collections
1000 BG Amsterdam 3251 Riverport Lane
The Netherlands Maryland Heights, MO 63043  USA
Fax: (+31) 20 485 2620 Fax: +1-877-223-1436
| |VisaCard | | Access/Euro/Mastercard | | American Express

Cardno ||| |- |- -

Expiry Date Month | | | Year| | |

Signature

Name

Elsevier Limited, The Boulevard, Langford Lane, Kidlington, Oxford, OX5 1GB, UK
VAT no. 494 6272 12



TERMS AND CONDITIONS

INVOICE NO. RP018045
29 October 2018

The University of Texas at Austin
attn: Andrew Sligar

107 W. Dean Keeton St

Austin, 78712

TX, United States
asligar(@utexas.edu

4176693356

COLOUR ATLAS OF ANATOMY OF SMALL LABORATORY ANIMALS (VOLUME 1) 2003, ISBN:
9780702026997, Rajtova et al ed, 1 figure only.

Proposed use: To be used in a journal/magazine "JoVE, Preclinical Model of Hind Limb Ischemia in Diabetic
Rabbits".

Permission to republish the material is granted subject to the following conditions:

Payment of the copyright fee of USD 118.50

If any part of the material to be used (for example, figures) has appeared in our publication with credit
or acknowledgement to another source, permission must also be sought from that source. If such
permission is not obtained, then that material may not be included in your publication/copies.

Suitable acknowledgment to the source must be made, either as a footnote or in a reference list at the
end of your publication, as follows: “This article was published in Publication title, Vol number,
Author(s), Title of article, Pages Nos, Copyright Elsevier (or appropriate Society name) (Year)”.

Reproduction of this material is confined to the purpose for which permission is hereby given and
for use on a non-commercial basis of handicapped persons and the blind.

This permission is for one time use and is granted for non-exclusive English world rights only. For
other languages, please reapply for permission separately. Permission EXCLUDES use in an electronic
form other than as specified above.

Elsevier Limited, The Boulevard, Langford Lane, Kidlington, Oxford, OX5 1GB, UK
VAT no. 494 6272 12
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